



Submitted by: Carolyn A. Dorazio  
Purchasing Agent

# TOWN OF SMITHFIELD

## BID TAB

Chromebook Laptops - Smithfield School Department

**BID OPENING: JUNE 20, 2018 at 10:00 AM**

BID ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY	Howard Technology Solutions P.O. Box 1590 Laurel, MS 39441		CDW Government LLC 230 N. Milwaukee Avenue Vernon Hills, IL 60061		Innovex 11 Powder Hill Road Lincoln, RI 02865	
			UNIT BID PRICE	TOTAL COST	UNIT BID PRICE	TOTAL COST	UNIT BID PRICE	TOTAL COST
1.1	Chromebook Laptops	740	373.00	276,020.00	324.00	239,760.00	357.22	264,342.80
2.2 A	HP 3 year Pickup and Return w/Accidental Damage Protection	740	73.00	54,020.00	51.00	37,740.00	72.19	53,420.60
2.2 B	Additional Power Adapter	740	59.00	43,660.00	26.00	19,240.00	58.78	43,497.20
2.2 C	Bump Armor 13" case	420	26.00	10,920.00	No Bid		31.50	13,230.00
2.2 D	Updating Chrome OS	740	Included in 2.2 E Price		6.00	4,440.00	55.00	40,700.00
2.2 E	Enrollment into Google Apps Domain	740	5.00	3,700.00	Included in 2.2 D Price		87.50	64,750.00
2.2 F	Custom Asset Tags Affixed	740	5.00	3,700.00	1.00	740.00	3.97	2,937.80
2.2 G	Laser Etching	740	5.00	3,700.00	5.00	3,700.00	No Bid	
2.2 H	Spreadsheet/CSV File Listing of Assets	740	Included		0.00	0.00	-	1,525.00

REFERRED TO THE EVALUATION COMMITTEE AND FUTURE RECOMMENDATION WILL BE FORWARDED TO THE TOWN COUNCIL AND SCHOOL COMMITTEE FOR APPROVAL.



# TOWN OF SMITHFIELD

## BID TAB

Chromebook Laptops - Smithfield School Department

**BID OPENING: JUNE 20, 2018 at 10:00 AM**

			Hypertec USA Inc. 1868 E. Broadway Road Tempe, AZ 85282		Insight Public Sector, Inc. 6820 South Harl Avenue Tempe, AZ 85283		OM Office Supply, Inc. 5007 Carlisle Pike, Suite 101 Mechanicsburg, PA 17050	
BID ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT BID PRICE	TOTAL COST	UNIT BID PRICE	TOTAL COST	UNIT BID PRICE	TOTAL COST
1.1	Chromebook Laptops	740	328.00	242,720.00	332.00	245,680.00	328.00	242,720.00
2.2 A	HP 3 year Pickup and Return w/Accidental Damage Protection	740	72.00	53,280.00	60.00	44,400.00	69.00	51,060.00
2.2 B	Additional Power Adapter	740	57.00	42,180.00	50.00	37,000.00	45.00	33,300.00
2.2 C	Bump Armor 13" case	420	25.46	10,693.20	26.00	10,920.00	24.75	10,395.00
2.2 D	Updating Chrome OS	740	Included in 1.1 Price		7.00	5,180.00	2.00	1,480.00
2.2 E	Enrollment into Google Apps Domain	740	Included in 2.2 F Price		Included in 2.2 D Price		2.00	1,480.00
2.2 F	Custom Asset Tags Affixed	740	22.00	16,280.00	Included in 2.2 D Price		7.00	5,180.00
2.2 G	Laser Etching	740	Included in 2.2 F Price		5.00	3,700.00	7.00	5,180.00
2.2 H	Spreadsheet/CSV File Listing of Assets	740	Included in 2.2 F Price		Included in 2.2 D Price		2.00	1,480.00



# TOWN OF SMITHFIELD

## BID TAB

Chromebook Laptops - Smithfield School Department

**BID OPENING: JUNE 20, 2018 at 10:00 AM**

			Whalley Computer Associates 25 Dorrance Street Providence, RI 02903		Staples Business Advantage 1901 Summit Tower Blvd Orlando, FL 32810		WB Mason 99 Bald Hill Road Cranston, RI 02920	
BID ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT BID PRICE	TOTAL COST	UNIT BID PRICE	TOTAL COST	UNIT BID PRICE	TOTAL COST
1.1	Chromebook Laptops	740	333.91	247,093.40	288.66	213,608.40	317.12	234,668.80
2.2 A	HP 3 year Pickup and Return w/Accidental Damage Protection	740	51.05	37,777.00	66.20	48,988.00	51.89	38,398.60
2.2 B	Additional Power Adapter	740	25.53	18,892.20	50.81	37,599.40	27.45	20,313.00
2.2 C	Bump Armor 13" case	420	25.92	10,886.40	No Bid		No Bid	
2.2 D	Updating Chrome OS	740	4.21	3,115.40	7.09	5,246.60	19.35	14,319.00
2.2 E	Enrollment into Google Apps Domain	740	Included in 2.2 D Price		Included in 2.2 D Price		Included in 2.2 D Price	
2.2 F	Custom Asset Tags Affixed	740	3.16	2,338.40	Included in 2.2 D Price		Included in 2.2 D Price	
2.2 G	Laser Etching	740	5.38	3,981.20	8.87	6,563.80	Included in 2.2 D Price	
2.2 H	Spreadsheet/CSV File Listing of Assets	740	0.00	0.00	1.78	1,317.20	Included in 2.2 D Price	