



# TOWN OF SMITHFIELD

## BID TAB

### CHROMEBOOK LAPTOPS - SMITHFIELD SCHOOL DEPARTMENT

BID OPENING: JULY 3, 2017 @ 10:00 AM

			CDW Government LLC 230 N. Milwaukee Avenue Vernon Hills, IL 60061		Connection Public Sector Solutions 732 Milford Road Merrimack, NH 03054		HUB Technical Services 44 Norfolk Avenue South Easton, MA 02375		Hypertec USA, Inc. 1868 E. Broadway Road Tempe, AZ 85282	
BID ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT BID PRICE	TOTAL COST	UNIT BID PRICE	TOTAL COST	UNIT BID PRICE	TOTAL COST	UNIT BID PRICE	TOTAL COST
1.1	Chromebook Laptops (Config 1)	620	234.50	145,390.00	264.52	164,002.40	266.69	165,347.80	231.49	143,523.80
1.2A	HP 3yr Pickup & Return Support	620	51.00	31,620.00	52.49	32,543.80	52.63	32,630.60	68.41	42,414.20
1.2B	Additional AC Adapter	620	26.00	16,120.00	26.49	16,423.80	26.32	16,318.40	42.48	26,337.60
1.2C	Belkin Air Protect Case	420	26.00	10,920.00	26.49	11,125.80	35.55	14,931.00	33.90	14,238.00
1.2D	Updating Chrome OS	620	6.00	3,720.00	26.49	16,423.80	7.50	4,650.00	7.58	4,699.60
1.2E	Enroll Google Apps	620	Included with Line 1.2D		5.00	3,100.00	7.50	4,650.00	24.18	14,991.60
1.2F	Asset Tags Affixed	620	1.00	620.00	Included with Line 1.2E		4.00	2,480.00	Included with Line 1.2D	
1.2G	Laser Etching	620	5.00	3,100.00	6.25	3,875.00	4.00	2,480.00	7.07	4,383.40
1.2H	Listing of Assets	620	Included with Extranet		0.00	0.00	1.50	930.00	Included with Line 1.2D	
2.1	Chromebook Laptops (Config 2)	620	310.00	192,200.00	339.49	210,483.80	342.63	212,430.60	329.37	204,209.40
2.2A	HP 3yr Pickup & Return Support	620	51.00	31,620.00	52.49	32,543.80	52.63	32,630.60	68.41	42,414.20
2.2B	Additional AC Adapter	620	26.00	16,120.00	26.49	16,423.80	35.47	21,991.40	41.02	25,432.40
2.2C	Bump Armor 13" Case	420	28.00	11,760.00	26.49	11,125.80	25.55	10,731.00	38.21	16,048.20
2.2D	Updating Chrome OS	620	6.00	3,720.00	-	-	7.50	4,650.00	7.58	4,699.60
2.2E	Enroll Google Apps	620	Included with Line 2.2D		-	-	7.50	4,650.00	24.18	14,991.60
2.2F	Asset Tags Affixed	620	1.00	620.00			4.00	2,480.00	Included with Line 2.2D	
2.2G	Laser Etching	620	5.00	3,100.00	21.00	13,020.00	4.00	2,480.00	7.07	4,383.40
2.2H	Listing of Assets	620	Included with Extranet		32.00	19,840.00	1.50	930.00	Included with Line 2.2D	
			1.2F & 2.2F Lines have min \$5 per unit, if selected Chromebook will be decreased by \$4 to sell for \$1 per		Alt: Belkin Air B2A074-C00					
			1.2G & 2.2G Lines have min \$11 per unit, if selected Chromebook will be decreased by \$6 to sell for \$5 per							

**REFERRED TO THE EVALUATION COMMITTEE AND FUTURE RECOMMENDATION WILL BE FORWARDED TO THE TOWN COUNCIL AND SCHOOL COMMITTEE FOR APPROVAL.**



# TOWN OF SMITHFIELD

## BID TAB

### CHROMEBOOK LAPTOPS - SMITHFIELD SCHOOL DEPARTMENT

BID OPENING: JULY 3, 2017 @ 10:00 AM

			Mohawk USA 458 Danbury Road B-3 New Milford, CT 06776		OM Office Supply, Inc. 5007 Carlisle Pike, Suite 101 Mechanicsburg, PA 17050		Riverside Technologies, Inc. 105 Gateway Drive North Sioux City, SD 57049		ScholarBuys 11 W Main Street - Suite 202 Carpentersville, IL 60110			
BID ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT BID PRICE	TOTAL COST	UNIT BID PRICE	TOTAL COST	UNIT BID PRICE	TOTAL COST	UNIT BID PRICE	TOTAL COST		
1.1	Chromebook Laptops (Config 1)	620	No Bid		252.00	156,240.00	237.00	146,940.00	253.75	157,325.00		
1.2A	HP 3yr Pickup & Return Support	620			68.50	42,470.00	55.00	34,100.00	55.00	34,100.00		
1.2B	Additional AC Adapter	620			43.10	26,722.00	45.50	28,210.00	29.00	17,980.00		
1.2C	Belkin Air Protect Case	420			34.00	14,280.00	Included with Line 1.2A		29.00	12,180.00		
1.2D	Updating Chrome OS	620			2.00	1,240.00	6.00	3,720.00	0.00	0.00		
1.2E	Enroll Google Apps	620			2.00	1,240.00	Included with Line 1.2D		6.00	3,720.00		
1.2F	Asset Tags Affixed	620			7.00	4,340.00	Included with Line 1.2D		4.00	2,480.00		
1.2G	Laser Etching	620			15.00	9,300.00	3.00	1,860.00	4.00	2,480.00		
1.2H	Listing of Assets	620			2.00	1,240.00	Included with Line 1.2D		0.00	0.00		
2.1	Chromebook Laptops (Config 2)	620			No Bid		355.00	220,100.00	335.50	208,010.00	327.94	203,322.80
2.2A	HP 3yr Pickup & Return Support	620	68.50	42,470.00			69.00	42,780.00	55.00	34,100.00		
2.2B	Additional AC Adapter	620	34.20	21,204.00			31.50	19,530.00	29.00	17,980.00		
2.2C	Bump Armor 13" Case	420	27.39	11,503.80			27.00	11,340.00	20.00	8,400.00	28.00	11,760.00
2.2D	Updating Chrome OS	620	2.00	1,240.00			6.00	3,720.00	0.00	0.00		
2.2E	Enroll Google Apps	620	No Bid		2.00	1,240.00	Included with Line 2.2D		6.00	3,720.00		
2.2F	Asset Tags Affixed	620			7.00	4,340.00	Included with Line 2.2D		4.00	2,480.00		
2.2G	Laser Etching	620			15.00	9,300.00	3.00	1,860.00	4.00	2,480.00		
2.2H	Listing of Assets	620			2.00	1,240.00	Included with Line 2.2D		0.00	0.00		

**REFERRED TO THE EVALUATION COMMITTEE AND FUTURE RECOMMENDATION WILL BE FORWARDED TO THE TOWN COUNCIL AND SCHOOL COMMITTEE FOR APPROVAL.**



# TOWN OF SMITHFIELD

## BID TAB

### CHROMEBOOK LAPTOPS - SMITHFIELD SCHOOL DEPARTMENT

BID OPENING: JULY 3, 2017 @ 10:00 AM

BID ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY	Staples Business Advantage 1096 E Newport Center Dr #300 Deerfield Beach, FL 33442		WB Mason 99 Bald Hill Road Cranston, RI 02920		Whalley Computer Associates 10 Dorrance Street Providence, RI 02903		Zone, Inc. 1102 15th St S.W. #102 Auburn, WA 98001	
			UNIT BID PRICE	TOTAL COST	UNIT BID PRICE	TOTAL COST	UNIT BID PRICE	TOTAL COST	UNIT BID PRICE	TOTAL COST
1.1	Chromebook Laptops (Config 1)	620	223.83	138,774.60	225.56	139,847.20	230.84	143,120.80	240.05	148,831.00
1.2A	HP 3yr Pickup & Return Support	620	51.55	31,961.00	50.09	31,055.80	50.00	31,000.00	51.18	31,731.60
1.2B	Additional AC Adapter	620	25.27	15,667.40	24.30	15,066.00	26.00	16,120.00	46.83	29,034.60
1.2C	Belkin Air Protect Case	420	35.23	14,796.60	36.09	15,157.80	35.15	14,763.00	26.01	10,924.20
1.2D	Updating Chrome OS	620	Included with Line 1.2E		8.15	5,053.00	Included with Line 1.2E		4.16	2,579.20
1.2E	Enroll Google Apps	620	5.15	3,193.00	Included with Line 1.2D		5.00	3,100.00	Included with Line 1.2D	
1.2F	Asset Tags Affixed	620	7.22	4,476.40	Included with Line 1.2D		4.00	2,480.00	3.65	2,263.00
1.2G	Laser Etching	620	18.56	11,507.20	11.10	6,882.00	7.99	4,953.80	4.16	2,579.20
1.2H	Listing of Assets	620	6.19	3,837.80	Included with Line 1.2D		Included with Line 1.2F		Included with Line 1.2F	
2.1	Chromebook Laptops (Config 2)	620	286.99	177,933.80	296.47	183,811.40	301.85	187,147.00	315.57	195,653.40
2.2A	HP 3yr Pickup & Return Support	620	51.55	31,961.00	50.09	31,055.80	50.00	31,000.00	51.18	31,731.60
2.2B	Additional AC Adapter	620	42.21	26,170.20	33.74	20,918.80	26.00	16,120.00	33.79	20,949.80
2.2C	Bump Armor 13" Case	420	40.27	16,913.40	26.32	11,054.40	26.52	11,138.40	No Bid	
2.2D	Updating Chrome OS	620	Included with Line 2.2E		8.15	5,053.00	Included with Line 2.2E		4.16	2,579.20
2.2E	Enroll Google Apps	620	5.15	3,193.00	Included with Line 2.2D		5.00	3,100.00	Included with Line 2.2D	
2.2F	Asset Tags Affixed	620	7.22	4,476.40	Included with Line 2.2D		4.00	2,480.00	3.65	2,263.00
2.2G	Laser Etching	620	18.56	11,507.20	11.10	6,882.00	7.99	4,953.80	4.16	2,579.20
2.2H	Listing of Assets	620	6.19	3,837.80	Included with Line 2.2D		Included with Line 2.2F		Included with Line 2.2F	
			Bundle Price for Lines D - H = \$20.62 or \$12,784.40							
			Alt: Targus TKC006 case							

**REFERRED TO THE EVALUATION COMMITTEE AND FUTURE RECOMMENDATION WILL BE FORWARDED TO THE TOWN COUNCIL AND SCHOOL COMMITTEE FOR APPROVAL.**