
TOWN OF SMITHFIELD

BID TAB

CHROMEBOOK LAPTOPS AND STORAGE CARTS - SMITHFIELD SCHOOL DEPARTMENT

BID OPENING: JULY 6, 2016 @ 10:00 AM

 

BID UNIT BID TOTAL UNIT BID TOTAL UNIT BID TOTAL UNIT BID TOTAL UNIT BID TOTAL

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST

1 Chromebook Laptops 600 No Bid - 162.50 97,500.00 203.00 121,800.00 188.00 112,800.00 180.93 108,558.00

2 Storage & Charging Cart 24 1,475.00 35,400.00 1,360.00 32,640.00 1,493.00 35,832.00 1,428.00 34,272.00 1,399.00 33,576.00

3A 1 yr. add OEM Warranty 600 No Bid - 10.50 6,300.00 11.70 7,020.00 9.80 5,880.00 11.70 7,020.00

3B 2 yr. add OEM Warranty 600 No Bid - 26.25 15,750.00 25.00 15,000.00 24.00 14,400.00 24.30 14,580.00

3C Add Accidental Damage 600 No Bid - 20.50 12,300.00 26.10 15,660.00 18.50 11,100.00 22.00 13,200.00

2 Year 600 No Bid - - - 38.55 23,130.00 38.20 22,920.00 - -

3 Year 600 No Bid - - - 41.25 24,750.00 34.50 20,700.00 - -

3D Additional AC Adapter 600 No Bid - 21.00 12,600.00 41.00 24,600.00 18.77 11,262.00 55.09 33,054.00

3E Belkin Air Protect Case 400 35.00 14,000.00 32.00 12,800.00 35.40 14,160.00 27.15 10,860.00 34.36 13,744.00

3F Updating Chrome OS 600 No Bid - 6.00 3,600.00 Included - 10.00 6,000.00

3G Enroll Google Apps 600 No Bid - 2.00 1,200.00 6.85 4,110.00

3H Asset Tags Affixed 600 No Bid - 5.00 3,000.00 3.00 1,800.00 4.45 2,670.00

3I Laser Etching 600 No Bid - 17.00 10,200.00 No Bid - 4.45 2,670.00

3J Listing of Assets 600 No Bid - Included - 1.00 600.00 1.25 750.00

65 Kreiger Lane

Glastonbury, CT  06033

Hypertec USA, Inc.

1868 E. Broadway Road

Tempe, AZ  85282

B&H Photo Video

420 Ninth Avenue

New York, NY 10001-1644

44 Norfolk Avenue230 N. Milwaukee Avenue

South Easton, MA  02375Vernon Hills, IL  60061

HUB Technical ServicesCDW Government LLC The Ergonomic Group, Inc.

Included in 3F Price

Included in 3F Price

Included in 3F Price

Included in 3F Price

Included in 3I Price

Included in 3I Price

REFERRED TO THE EVALUATION COMMITTEE AND FUTURE RECOMMENDATION WILL BE FORWARDED TO THE TOWN COUNCIL AND 

SCHOOL COMMITTEE  FOR APPROVAL. Prepared by: Randy R. Rossi



TOWN OF SMITHFIELD

BID TAB

CHROMEBOOK LAPTOPS AND STORAGE CARTS - SMITHFIELD SCHOOL DEPARTMENT

BID OPENING: JULY 6, 2016 @ 10:00 AM

 

BID

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY

1 Chromebook Laptops 600

2 Storage & Charging Cart 24

3A 1 yr. add OEM Warranty 600

3B 2 yr. add OEM Warranty 600

3C Add Accidental Damage 600

2 Year 600

3 Year 600

3D Additional AC Adapter 600

3E Belkin Air Protect Case 400

3F Updating Chrome OS 600

3G Enroll Google Apps 600

3H Asset Tags Affixed 600

3I Laser Etching 600

3J Listing of Assets 600

UNIT BID TOTAL UNIT BID TOTAL UNIT BID TOTAL UNIT BID TOTAL UNIT BID TOTAL

PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST

158.57 95,142.00 208.00 124,800.00 187.95 112,770.00 183.29 109,974.00 183.00 109,800.00

1,422.01 34,128.24 1,400.00 33,600.00 No Bid - 1,369.00 32,856.00 1,415.00 33,960.00

27.43 16,458.00 30.00 18,000.00 20.00 12,000.00 27.00 16,200.00 13.00 7,800.00

46.22 27,732.00 60.00 36,000.00 39.00 23,400.00 45.95 27,570.00 25.00 15,000.00

30.00 18,000.00 19.42 11,652.00 37.00 22,200.00

- - - - 44.00 26,400.00 - - - -

85.88 51,528.00 - - 59.00 35,400.00 - - - -

23.18 13,908.00 56.60 33,960.00 No Bid - 18.97 11,382.00 No Bid -

26.44 10,576.00 34.50 13,800.00 25.00 10,000.00 25.00 10,000.00 26.00 10,400.00

4.97 2,982.00 5.00 3,000.00 8.23 4,938.00 Included -

2.00 1,200.00 6.00 3,600.00 5.00 3,000.00

8.00 4,800.00 3.00 1,800.00

10.00 6,000.00 12.00 7,200.00 5.00 3,000.00 No Bid -

2.00 1,200.00 No Bid -

Insight Public Sector, Inc.

6820 South Harl Avenue

Tempe, AZ  85283

Riverside Technologies, Inc.

105 Gateway Drive

North Sioux City, SD  57049

SHI International Corp

290 Davidson Avenue

Somerset, NJ  08873

SAITECH Inc.

42640 Christy Street

Fremont, CA  94538

5007 Carlisle Pike, Suite 101

Mechanicsburg, PA  17050

OM Office Supply, Inc.

Included in 3F Price

Included in 3F Price

Included in 3F Price

Included in 3F Price

See Below

Included in 3G Price

Included in 3G Price

Included in 3G Price

See Below

Included in 3F Price

Included in 3F Price

Included in 3F Price

REFERRED TO THE EVALUATION COMMITTEE AND FUTURE RECOMMENDATION WILL BE FORWARDED TO THE TOWN COUNCIL AND 

SCHOOL COMMITTEE  FOR APPROVAL. Prepared by: Randy R. Rossi



TOWN OF SMITHFIELD

BID TAB

CHROMEBOOK LAPTOPS AND STORAGE CARTS - SMITHFIELD SCHOOL DEPARTMENT

BID OPENING: JULY 6, 2016 @ 10:00 AM

 

BID

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY

1 Chromebook Laptops 600

2 Storage & Charging Cart 24

3A 1 yr. add OEM Warranty 600

3B 2 yr. add OEM Warranty 600

3C Add Accidental Damage 600

2 Year 600

3 Year 600

3D Additional AC Adapter 600

3E Belkin Air Protect Case 400

3F Updating Chrome OS 600

3G Enroll Google Apps 600

3H Asset Tags Affixed 600

3I Laser Etching 600

3J Listing of Assets 600

UNIT BID TOTAL UNIT BID TOTAL UNIT BID TOTAL

PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST

190.00 114,000.00 192.37 115,422.00 184.86 110,916.00

1,500.00 36,000.00 1,445.00 34,680.00 1,650.00 39,600.00

7.00 4,200.00 49.00 29,400.00 11.99 7,194.00

28.50 17,100.00 70.00 42,000.00 24.99 14,994.00

70.00 42,000.00

- - - - 49.99 29,994.00

- - - - 67.69 40,614.00

27.00 16,200.00 21.00 12,600.00 56.59 33,954.00

38.00 15,200.00 23.28 9,312.00 36.69 14,676.00

13.50 8,100.00 24.49 14,694.00

3.75 2,250.00

3.75 2,250.00 12.15 7,290.00

3.75 2,250.00

5.00 3,000.00

4675 E. Cotton Center - Suite 155

Phoenix, AZ  85040

WB Mason

99 Bald Hill Road

Cranston, RI  02920

Staples Business Advantage

1901 Summit Tower Blvd

Orlando, FL  32810

Troxell Communications

Included in 3F Price

Included in 3H Price

Included in 3H Price

Included in price for 3A or 3B See Below

Included in 3F Price

Included in 3F Price

Included in 3F Price

Included in 3F Price

N/A

REFERRED TO THE EVALUATION COMMITTEE AND FUTURE RECOMMENDATION WILL BE FORWARDED TO THE TOWN COUNCIL AND 

SCHOOL COMMITTEE  FOR APPROVAL. Prepared by: Randy R. Rossi


