
Prepared by: Randy R. Rossi

Finance Director

Ahlborg Construction Corp. Martone Service Company Mill City Construction Robert H. Lord Company

BID 21 College Hill Road - 2nd Fl 22 Sextant Lane 7 Old Great Road 220 Chapel Road

ITEM DESCRIPTION Warwick, RI  02886 Narragansett, RI  02882 Lincoln, RI  02865 Manchester, CT  06042

A Removal and Replacement of Gym Bleachers 135,000.00                        117,017.00                        114,597.00                        110,918.00                        

B
Removal and Replacement of Gym Divider 

Curtain
32,000.00                          19,977.00                          21,808.00                          19,499.00                          

C Painting of Gym Walls, Doors & Ceiling 38,000.00                          23,917.00                          32,564.00                          No Bid

D Gym Floor Repairs and Refinishing 55,000.00                          42,917.00                          45,154.00                          No Bid

E Gym Wall Padding 25,000.00                          18,861.00                          21,668.00                          18,539.00                          

F
Convert Existing Lavatory into Fully ADA 

Code Complaint Lavatory
29,000.00                          No Bid 28,113.00                          No Bid

REFERRED TO THE EVALUATION COMMITTEE AND FUTURE RECOMMENDATION WILL BE FORWARDED TO THE TOWN COUNCIL 

AND SCHOOL COMMITTEE FOR APPROVAL.

TOWN OF SMITHFIELD

BID TAB

Smithfield High School Upgrades - Smithfield School Department

BID OPENING: June 1, 2016 @ 10:00AM


