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TOWN OF SMITHFIELD

BID TAB

CAFETERIA LUNCH TABLES - SMITHFIELD SCHOOL DEPARTMENT
BID OPENING: July 29, 2015 @ 10:00AM
i-Design Group, Inc.

Robert H. Lord Company School Specialty, Inc.

Randy R. Rossi
Finance Department

Virco, Inc.

39 Semple Village Road 220 Chapel Road 100 Paragon Parkway

PO Box 5000

Attleboro, MA 02703 Manchester, CT 06042 Mansfield, OH 44903

Conway, AR 72033

| Item |Description | Bid Price Per Unit | | Bid Price Per Unit | | Bid Price Per Unit | | Bid Price Per Unit |
| 1 [Folding and Portable Tables with Benches | 1,417.52 [ 1,419.25 [ 1,388.81 [ 1,143.06 |
| ALT 1A [Edge Option | 1,127.52 [ No Bid [ 1,290.42 [ 1,081.61 |
| ALT 1B [Powder Coated Finish | 1,356.04 | 1,375.50 | 1,152.32 || No Additional Charge |
| 2 |Folding and Portable Round Tables with Stools | 1,084.60 [ 1,092.50 [ 1,030.59 [ 1,022.12 |
| ALT 2A [Edge Option | 974.40 [ No Bid [ 991.04 [ 974.43 |
| ALT 2B [Powder Coated Finish | 1,023.12 | 1,077.99 | 913.81 ||  No Additional Charge |
| 3 |Folding and Portable Round Tables w/ Wheelchair | 591.02 [ 715.95 [ 894.81 [ 1,240.47 |
| ALT 3A [Edge Option | 509.82 [ No Bid [ 853.99 [ 1,181.47 |
| ALT 3B [Powder Coated Finish | 584.06 | 686.95 | 799.52 || No Additional Charge |
| 4 |Adjustable Stools | 66.12 [ No Bid [ 47.56 [ 181.00 |

COMMITTEE FOR APPROVAL.

REFERRED TO THE EVALUATION COMMITTEE FOR REVIEW AND FUTURE RECOMMENDATION WILL BE FORWARDED TO THE TOWN COUNCIL AND SCHOOL




