
Insurance Company:

Broker:

Basic Coverage

Coverage 2015-2016 2016-2017 2017-2018 2015-2016 2016-2017 2017-2018 2015-2016 2016-2017 2017-2018 2015-2016 2016-2017 2017-2018

Class 1 Monthly Cost per $1,000 0.4750 0.4750 0.4750 0.48 0.48 0.48 0.774 no bid no bid 0.365 no bid no bid

Class 2 Monthly Cost per $1,000 0.4750 0.4750 0.4750 0.48 0.48 0.48 0.774 no bid no bid 0.365 no bid no bid

Class 3 Monthly Cost per $1,000 0.4750 0.4750 0.4750 0.48 0.48 0.48 0.774 no bid no bid 0.365 no bid no bid

Class 4 Monthly Cost per $1,000 0.4750 0.4750 0.4750 0.48 0.48 0.48 0.774 no bid no bid 0.365 no bid no bid

Class 5 Monthly Cost per $1,000 0.4750 0.4750 0.4750 0.48 0.48 0.48 2.474 no bid no bid 0.365 no bid no bid

Class 6 Monthly Cost per $1,000 0.4750 0.4750 0.4750 0.48 0.48 0.48 2.474 no bid no bid 0.365 no bid no bid

Class 7 Monthly Cost per $1,000 0.4750 0.4750 0.4750 0.48 0.48 0.48 2.474 no bid no bid 0.365 no bid no bid

Class 8 Monthly Cost per $1,000 0.4750 0.4750 0.4750 0.48 0.48 0.48 2.474 no bid no bid 0.365 no bid no bid

Class 9 Monthly Cost per $1,000 0.4750 0.4750 0.4750 0.48 0.48 0.48 2.474 no bid no bid 0.365 no bid no bid

Class 10 Monthly Cost per $1,000 0.4750 0.4750 0.4750 0.48 0.48 0.48 2.474 no bid no bid 0.365 no bid no bid

Attained Age

Rates are Monthly / $1,000

Attained Age 2015-2016 2016-2017 2017-2018 2015-2016 2016-2017 2017-2018 2015-2016 2016-2017 2017-2018 2015-2016 2016-2017 2017-2018

<20 0.0500 0.0500 0.0500 0.0580 0.0580 0.0580 0.0470 0.0470 0.0470 0.042 no bid no bid

20-24 0.0500 0.0500 0.0500 0.0580 0.0580 0.0580 0.0470 0.0470 0.0470 0.042 no bid no bid

25-29 0.0600 0.0600 0.0600 0.0560 0.0560 0.0560 0.0570 0.0570 0.0570 0.050 no bid no bid

30-34 0.0800 0.0800 0.0800 0.0700 0.0700 0.0700 0.0820 0.0820 0.0820 0.067 no bid no bid

35-39 0.0900 0.0900 0.0900 0.1020 0.1020 0.1020 0.1260 0.1260 0.1260 0.075 no bid no bid

40-44 0.1200 0.1200 0.1200 0.1550 0.1550 0.1550 0.1910 0.1910 0.1910 0.084 no bid no bid

45-49 0.2100 0.2100 0.2100 0.2490 0.2490 0.2490 0.2930 0.2930 0.2930 0.126 no bid no bid

50-54 0.3700 0.3700 0.3700 0.4040 0.4040 0.4040 0.4300 0.4300 0.4300 0.193 no bid no bid

55-59 0.6100 0.6100 0.6100 0.6410 0.6410 0.6410 0.6050 0.6050 0.6050 0.360 no bid no bid

60-64 0.7500 0.7500 0.7500 0.8830 0.8830 0.8830 0.7620 0.7620 0.7620 0.552 no bid no bid

65-69 1.3100 1.3100 1.3100 1.4020 1.4020 1.4020 1.0930 1.0930 1.0930 1.063 no bid no bid

REFERRED TO THE EVALUATION COMMITTEE AND FUTURE RECOMMENDATION WILL BE FORWARDED TO THE TOWN COUNCIL AND SCHOOL COMMITTEE FOR 

APPROVAL.

Symetra Life Insurance 

777 108th Avenue NE, Suite 1200

Bellevue, WA 98005-5135

Symetra Life Insurance 

A.R. Bucci Insurance

UNUM

P.O. Box 948094

Maitland, FL  32794-8094

Minnesota Life Sun Life Assurance, Co.

A.R. Bucci Insurance Paul Santucci Financial Services

UNUM

National Benefit Service Center

GROUP LIFE INSURANCE - SMITHFIELD SCHOOL DEPARTMENT (RE-BID)

BID OPENING: June 18, 2015 @ 10:00AM

Vendor:
Minnesota Life Paul Santucci Financial Services

400 Robert Street North 1559 Hartford Avenue

St. Paul, MN  55101 Johnston, RI  02919

Submitted by: Randy R. Rossi

Prepared by: Finance Department

TOWN OF SMITHFIELD

BID TAB


