
Submitted by: Randy R. Rossi

Prepared by: Finance Department

Peterson Oil Santa Buckley Energy * Superior Plus Energy Srvs.

75 Crescent Street 154 Admiral Street 12 Hylestead Street

Worcester, MA  01605 Bridgeport, CT  06605 Providence, RI  02905

Unleaded 0.0650 0.0721 No Bid

Plus Unleaded 0.0650 No Bid No Bid

Super Unleaded 0.0650 No Bid No Bid

Winter Diesel 0.0500 0.0680 0.0421

#1 Premium Diesel 0.0700 0.0680 0.0421

New Ultra Diesel 0.0400 0.0680 0.0421

Unleaded 0.0500 0.0409 No Bid

Plus Unleaded 0.0500 No Bid No Bid

Super Unleaded 0.0500 No Bid No Bid

Winter Diesel 0.0475 0.0411 0.0321

#1 Premium Diesel 0.0700 0.0411 0.0321

New Ultra Diesel 0.0350 0.0411 0.0321

Unleaded 0.0650 0.1047 No Bid

Plus Unleaded 0.0650 No Bid No Bid

Super Unleaded 0.0650 No Bid No Bid

Winter Diesel 0.0500 0.1006 0.0547

#1 Premium Diesel 0.0700 0.1006 0.0547

New Ultra Diesel 0.0400 0.1006 0.0547

Unleaded 0.0650 0.0596 No Bid

Plus Unleaded 0.0650 No Bid No Bid

Super Unleaded 0.0650 No Bid No Bid

Winter Diesel 0.0500 0.0505 0.0421

#1 Premium Diesel 0.0700 0.0505 0.0421

New Ultra Diesel 0.0400 0.0505 0.0421

Unleaded 0.0400 0.0318 No Bid

Plus Unleaded 0.0400 0.0245 No Bid

Super Unleaded 0.0400 0.0707 No Bid

Winter Diesel 0.0500 0.0358 0.0298

#1 Premium Diesel 0.0700 0.0358 0.0298

New Ultra Diesel 0.0400 0.0358 0.0298

Unleaded 0.0800 0.0423 No Bid

Plus Unleaded 0.0400 0.0393 No Bid

Super Unleaded 0.0400 No Bid No Bid

Winter Diesel 0.0500 0.0358 0.0321

#1 Premium Diesel 0.0700 0.0358 0.0321

New Ultra Diesel 0.0400 0.0358 0.0321

Unleaded 0.0900 0.0711 No Bid

Plus Unleaded 0.0900 No Bid No Bid

Super Unleaded 0.0900 No Bid No Bid

Winter Diesel 0.0900 0.0676 0.0547

#1 Premium Diesel 0.0900 0.0676 0.0547

New Ultra Diesel 0.0600 0.0676 0.0547

District 4

District 5

District 6

District 7

District 1

District 2

District 3

TOWN OF SMITHFIELD

BID TAB

Gasoline and Diesel for Participating Municipalities Co-operative Purchasing

BID OPENING: December 9, 2014 @ 10:00AM
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Peterson Oil Santa Buckley Energy * Superior Plus Energy Srvs.

75 Crescent Street 154 Admiral Street 12 Hylestead Street

Worcester, MA  01605 Bridgeport, CT  06605 Providence, RI  02905

TOWN OF SMITHFIELD

BID TAB

Gasoline and Diesel for Participating Municipalities Co-operative Purchasing

BID OPENING: December 9, 2014 @ 10:00AM

Unleaded 0.0650 0.0497 No Bid

Plus Unleaded 0.0650 0.0458 No Bid

Super Unleaded 0.0650 No Bid No Bid

Winter Diesel 0.0500 0.0434 0.0321

#1 Premium Diesel 0.0700 0.0434 0.0321

New Ultra Diesel 0.0600 0.0434 0.0321

Unleaded 0.0650 0.0541 No Bid

Plus Unleaded 0.0650 No Bid No Bid

Super Unleaded 0.0650 No Bid No Bid

Winter Diesel 0.0500 0.0507 0.0321

#1 Premium Diesel 0.0700 0.0507 0.0321

New Ultra Diesel 0.0500 0.0507 0.0321

Unleaded No Bid 0.0679 No Bid

Plus Unleaded No Bid No Bid No Bid

Super Unleaded No Bid 0.0737 No Bid

Winter Diesel No Bid 0.0695 0.0421

#1 Premium Diesel No Bid 0.0695 0.0421

New Ultra Diesel No Bid 0.0695 0.0421

Unleaded 0.0900 0.0596 No Bid

Plus Unleaded 0.0900 0.0962 No Bid

Super Unleaded 0.0900 0.0952 No Bid

Winter Diesel 0.0900 0.0947 No Bid

#1 Premium Diesel 0.0900 0.0947 No Bid

New Ultra Diesel 0.0900 0.0947 No Bid

No Bid $425 + District 10 Rates $250 + District 10 Rates

District 9

District 10

District 11

Prudence Island Delivery

* Note: See Attachment A from Santa Buckley concerning terms and conditions.

District 8



HEATING AND MOTOR FUELS • NATURAL GAS • ELECTRICITY • DUAL FUEL • OTHER ENERGY PRODUCTS AND SERVICES • ENERGY CONSULTING

Santa Buckley Energy, Inc.
P.O. Box 1141 P 800-739-1852

^BuckleyEnergyBridgeport, CT06601-1141 F 203-367-2412

ATTACHMENT: A

Town of Smithfield

and Participating Municipalities Co-Operative Purchasing
Request for Proposal
Gasoline and Diesel

9 December 2014 @ 10:00 am
Terms & Conditions

Bid prices do not include taxes for which the Town of Smithfield and Participating Municipalities (Customer) is
responsible for. It is the Customer's responsibility to provide valid exemption certificates for tax exemptions
requested.

The incremental offeredpricesare basedon Portof Providence, RJ Posting(s) on the day of delivery.

Bid for Town of Portsmouth, Prudence Island Locations:

Delivery Charge: $425.00 per delivery plus fuel
Delivery Location; 1351 Narragansett Ave. Prudence Island, Portsmouth, R1
Minimum three (3) day notice required for scheduling a delivery; deliveries are contingent upon operation and
scheduling of the Prudence Island Ferry service.
Additional time beyond 3 hour delivery time (portal to portal Bristol, RI ferry dock) is charged at $56.25 per V* hour
(fifteen minutes) or any portion thereof.
Ferry charges paid by the Town of Portsmouth, Rl
Deliveries between November 1st and March 31st are on a best efforts basis, expect delays lasting weeks
Award must accompany the Town of Portsmouth Award

The Oil Price Daily (OPD) published by Oil Price Information Service (OPIS) publication is Copyrighted material
therefore by copyright laws Santa Buckley is not allowed to forward orprovide copies ofthe OPD. The Customer is
hereby notified that the prices posted in the OPD change daily and it is the responsibility of the Customer to verify
the OPD posted price. Santa Buckley provides the Customer with notification of price changes through the
invoicing process.

Award of this bid to Santa Buckley will constitute the Customers' full acceptance of the above terms and conditions
and any other language in the biddocument(s) or subsequent contract documents notwithstanding.

Notice of Award:

Bysigning below, Customer hereby confirms the Notice of Award byCustomer in favor of Santa Buckley and
acknowledges the acceptance by Customer of the Terms andConditions set forth herein. Upon signing, kindly
returna copy by fax to (203) 367-2412, Attn: LexJohnsonor e-mail atjohnsonl@santaenergy.com.

Duly Authorized By:

Date:

Signature

Printed Name

Title
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TOWN OF SMITHFIELD 
State of Rhode Island 

 

 

 

Item Description: Gasoline and Diesel for Participating Municipalities Co-operative Purchasing 

Date and Time to be OPENED: Tuesday, December 9, 2014 at 10:00 AM 

 
 

DISTRICTS FOR FUEL PURCHASE DELIVERY 
 

 
District 1      District 7 
Burrillville  Hopkinton 

Glocester      Richmond 
       Exeter 
District 2 Charlestown 
Woonsocket Westerly 
North Smithfield  
Smithfield District 8 
Cumberland Jamestown 
Lincoln    Narragansett 
Central Falls South Kingstown 
North Providence   
 District 9 
District 3 Warren 
Foster  Bristol 
Scituate Barrington 

        

District 4 District 10 
Coventry  Tiverton 
West Greenwich Portsmouth 
 Portsmouth – Prudence Island 
District 5  Middletown 

Pawtucket Newport 
Providence      Little Compton 
Johnston   
East Providence District 11 
 North Kingstown 
District 6       
Warwick  
East Greenwich  
West Warwick  
Cranston       

 



TOWN OF SMITHFIELD 
State of Rhode Island 

 

 

VENDOR CONTACT INFORMATION 
 
 

 

VENDER 

 

 

VENDOR CONTACT 

 

TELEPHONE 

 

 
Peterson Oil 
75 Crescent Street 
Worcester, MA  01605 

 
 
Wendy Renzi 
wrenzi@petersonoil.com 

 
 

(508) 688-4728 
 
 

 
Santa Buckley Energy, Inc. 
154 Admiral Street 
Bridgeport, CT  06605 

 
 
Lex Johnson 
johnsonl@santaenergy.com 

 
 

(203) 336-3541 
 
 

 
Superior Plus Energy Services 
12 Hylestead Street 
Providence, RI  02905 

 
 
Michael O’Rourke 
Mike_Orourke@superiorplusenergy.com 

 
 

(401) 467-6510 ext. 736 
(401) 280-0962 

 

 
 
 
 

Please contact each vendor directly with any questions and to enter into an individual agreement 

between your municipality and the vendor in the best interest of your municipality. 


