OPENED 7/27/12 at 10:00 AM SMITHFIELD SCHOOL DEPARTMENT
JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
BID TAB 2012-2013

TYPE SIZE DESCRIPTION QTY. | UNIT [ Airwick | All Amer. | Arrow | Banner | Casey | East.Bag | Ecolab | Interboro | Milhench | Pyramid | Sam Tell | Supreme | Unipak | Mason

1|Air Spray 320z can #SPSanityze 16 oz. 12 cans p/cs Disinfect Deodorant 15 Case 41.18 no bid| 23.88 35.16] 50.40 27.201 53.08 no bid 38.30 25.98 no bid no bid no bid 34.57

4|Brush Handles,Floor 60~ Natural Polished Hardwood-Threaded 10 Each 1.98 no bid 2.33 3.00] no bid 1.95] nobid no bid 2.52 2.39 3.05 2.93 no bid 2.89

7|Cleaner (All Purpose)APSimonize 5 Gallon w/handle Strongest Strength/Top Quality 15 Pail 19.85 nobid| 21.38 18.10] 32.30 no bid| no bid no bid 36.03 no bid no bid nobid] nobid| nobid

8|Cleaner Quaternary Fungicidal 5 Gallon Mint Deodorant Quat32 50 Pail 28.49 no bid[  29.80 20.20[ nobid no bid| no bid no bid 36.60 no bid no bid 30.62[ nobid| nobid
12{Dry Mop, Blue 5 x 18 5x18 Launderable Standard 50 Each 3.72 no bid 4.48 5.61 6.10 4.99] nobid no bid 5.76 4.99 5.09 no bid no bid 4.70
13|Dry Mop, Blue 5 x 48 5x48 Launderable Standard 24 Each 7.49 no bid 9.35 10.35( 12.50 14.50( no bid no bid 12.10 10.99 11.13 no bid no bid 9.95
15|Dust Mop Treatment Oil Based Spray 10p/cs  |Flammability not to exceed 2 15 Case 47.29 no bid| 68.40 no bid| no bid nobid| 62.15 no bid 28.75 no bid no bid no bid no bid 36.92
16Floor Tile Sealer 5 Gallon Simoniz-sample required if substituting 10 Pail 42.90 nobid| 39.40 34201 48.50 no bid| *27.65 no bid 45.66 no bid 52.50 49.68 no bid 52.79
18|Furniture Polish 14 oz. Pledge or Equal (Cans) 120 Each 3.73 no bid 2.88 35.48 3.85 2.14 3.14 no bid 2.33 2.44 no bid 3.16 no bid 2.49
19|Glass Cleaner Gallon 4 gallons p/case LAGBWK3414 15 | Case 14.29 nobid[ 12.40 13.29 no bid 14.80[ 38.31 no bid 18.56 no bid no bid nobid| nobid| 11.53
20|Hornet Spray 14 oz. Aerosol Cans, EPA & USDA Approved 30 Each 3.69 no bid 3.90 43.83| no bid no bid| no bid no bid 4.16 *3.09 no bid *61.18 no bid| no bid
21|Liquid Laundry Detergent Gallon 4 gallons p/case CALISZL.2148004 6 Case 23.00 nobid| 31.88 44.08| no bid no bid| no bid no bid 25.42 no bid no bid nobid| nobid| 22.24
25|Pails, Garbage 32 Gallon Rubbermaid Contico 3200GY 5 Each 18.40 no bid| 25.80 17.33] no bid 24.55] nobid no bid 21.60 28.95 20.25 no bid nobid|  26.29
27|Paper Towel (rolls) 8" 350" white 2"core 12 p/cs 400 Case 22.45 nobid| 16.24 23.27| no bid 1591 nobid no bid 21.90 no bid no bid 20.34 no bid 18.98
28|Plastic Spray Bottle Triggers For One-Quart Spray Bottles 50 Each 0.78 no bid 0.62 0.50] no bid 0.45] nobid no bid 0.74 0.47 0.44 no bid no bid 0.54
29|Plastic Spray Bottles Quart For Trigger Spray 50 Each 0.57 no bid 0.62 0.57] no bid 0.45] no bid no bid 0.68 0.46 0.43 no bid no bid 0.58
30(Plastic Trash Bags INT3340med 11 micron 33x40 33gal container 250p/cs CLEAR 350 Case 11.73 26.53| 26.88 17.96] no bid 12.99] no bid 9.82 11.22 no bid no bid 20.40 17.89 11.42
32|Soap, Foam Hand*** 1000mil 6 bags p/cs KUTOL Prod#69041 120 Case 32.99 nobid| 39.24 no bid| no bid nobid| 50.25 no bid 34.20 no bid no bid no bid no bid| no bid
34(Sponges 5p/pkg 81/2x4 172 one side sponge/one side scrubber * 24 Pkg. 21.73 no bid 2.84 no bid| no bid no bid| no bid no bid 7.98 7.99 no bid no bid no bid 7.36
35(Swivel Dry Mop Handle 60” w/blk. swivel end (for blue mop heads) 15 Each 4.66 no bid 7.34 6.20] no bid 8.96] mno bid no bid 4.02 4.99 7.88 no bid no bid 9.86
36|Toilet tissue (rolls) 41/2x4 1/2 500 2 ply sheets 96 rolls p/case 160 Case 34.77 no bid| 28.74 30.77] no bid 29.87] nobid no bid 32.20 no bid no bid 34.80 no bid| *28.50
38| Vinyl Gloves Medium Disposable 100 p/box 10 Box 242 no bid 2.59 2.88 3.98 2.42] mnobid 3.40 2.97 3.59 no bid 2.56 no bid 2.68
39(Vinyl Gloves Large Disposable 100 p/box 350 Box 242 no bid 2.59 2.88 3.98 2.42( nobid 3.40 2.97 3.59 3.89 2.56 no bid 2.68
40(Vinyl Gloves X-Large Disposable 100 p/box 10 Box 242 no bid 2.59 2.88 3.98 2.42] mnobid 3.40 2.97 3.59 no bid 2.56 no bid 2.68
41|Wax, Floor 5-Gallon Simoniz-sample required if substituting 25 Pail 40.25 no bid| 44.38 37.25] 44.00 no bid| no bid no bid 43.08 no bid 57.85 61.65 no bid 47.62
42|Wax, Floor & Polish Remover 5-Gallon Simoniz-sample required if substituting 10 Pail 21.35 nobid| 42.90 20.001 38.00 no bid| no bid no bid 29.82 no bid 46.25 28.18 no bid 34.13
43|Wet Mop Heads 20 oz. Lightweight, wide band/looped end 30 Dozen 44.79 nobid| 77.28 42.84] 48.00 60.00] no bid no bid 3.53 35.88 46.32 no bid no bid 43.49
44|Wet Mop Heads SLD4600890 24 oz. Lightweight, wide band/looped end 30 | Dozen 50.75 nobid| 91.68 50.16] 58.00 84.00] no bid no bid 52.08 51.48 59.04 no bid nobid| 43.84
45|Wet Mop Handles 60” Grabber-extra durable jaw style 10 Each 4.92 no bid 6.24 5.21 10.20 8.96 no bid no bid 9.72 5.99 8.93 no bid no bid 6.86
47|Purell hand sanitizer 8/Pkg 1L 33.8 FL oz reorder no. 2156 20 Case 76.20 nobid| 63.40 no bid| no bid 61.45] no bid no bid 72.12 no bid no bid 83.12 no bid 66.19
49]|Gym floor cleaner/polisher Gallon Super Shine All 20 Each 8.25 no bid 7.38 no bid| no bid no bid| no bid no bid 7.66 no bid no bid no bid no bid| no bid
50[Scouring powder LAGCPC04275 cans 140z Ajax or equal 48 Each 0.74 no bid 0.89 0.66] no bid 1.95| nobid no bid 30.65 no bid no bid nobid[  nobid 0.58




